

BID TABS - MARCH 2022 LETTING

| County | | Date: 3/14/2022 | | Name and Address of Bidders: | | Renner Quarries Ltd (Robbins Rd.) | | | | | Renner Quarries Ltd (Renner Rd.) | | | | | Macklin Inc. (Stone Ridge) | | | | | Helm Civil (Palmyra) | | | | | Martin & Company (Oregon) | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---|---|--|------|------------------------------|------------|--|------------|-----------|-------|-------------------|--|------------|-----------|-------|-------------------|---------------------------------------|------------|-----------|---------|-------------------|---|------------|-----------|-----------|-------------------|--|------------|-----------|-------|-------------------|------------------|------------|----------|-------|-------------------|----------|--|--|--|--|-------|--|--|--|--|-------------------|--|--|--|--|-------|--|--|--|--|
| R.D.: | | Time: 9:00 A.M. | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | 1700 S. Galena Ave Dixon, IL. 61021 | | | | | 1700 S. Galena Ave Dixon, IL. 61021 | | | | | 6098 Dement Rd Rochelle, IL. 61068 | | | | | 2283 US Rt 20 E, PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 | | | | | 2456 E Pleasant Grove Rd Oregon, IL 61061 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| AGGREGATE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE B, CA-10 | | | | | | Bond N/A | | | | | Prequalified N/A | | | | | Bond N/A | | | | | Prequalified N/A | | | | | Bond N/A | | | | | Prequalified N/A | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: | | | | | | Material | | | | | Haul | | | | | Material | | | | | Haul | | | | | Material | | | | | Haul | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Terms: | | | | | | Unit Price | | | | | SubTotal | | | | | Miles | | | | | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | | | | | Total | | | | | Unit Price | | | | | SubTotal | | | | | Miles | | | | | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | | | | | Total | | | | |
| Section | Group | | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | SubTotal | Miles | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | Total | Unit Price | SubTotal | Miles | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | Total | Unit Price | SubTotal | Miles | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | Total | Unit Price | SubTotal | Miles | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | Total | Unit Price | SubTotal | Miles | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | Total | Unit Price | SubTotal | Miles | Miles x 33¢ x QTY | Total | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-05000-03-GM A502 Brooklyn Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 1,000 | \$6.35 | \$6,350.00 | \$ 6.75 | 6,750.00 | 17 | \$5,610.00 | \$12,360.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 26 | \$8,580.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.10 | 6,100.00 | 12 | \$3,960.00 | \$10,060.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 38 | \$12,540.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 6,000.00 | 24 | \$7,920.00 | \$13,920.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-08000-03-GM A802 East Grove Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 4,000 | \$6.35 | \$25,400.00 | \$ 6.75 | 27,000.00 | 11 | \$14,520.00 | \$41,520.00 | \$ 6.45 | 25,800.00 | 11 | \$14,520.00 | \$40,320.00 | \$ 6.10 | 24,400.00 | 34 | \$44,880.00 | \$69,280.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 28 | \$36,960.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 24,000.00 | 31 | \$40,920.00 | \$64,920.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-10000-03-GM A1002 Harmon Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 2,000 | \$6.35 | \$12,700.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 13 | \$8,580.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.45 | 12,900.00 | 11 | \$7,260.00 | \$20,160.00 | \$ 6.10 | 12,200.00 | 34 | \$22,440.00 | \$34,640.00 | \$ 7.50 | 15,000.00 | 21 | \$13,860.00 | \$28,860.00 | \$ 6.00 | 12,000.00 | 29 | \$19,140.00 | \$31,140.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-11000-03-GM A1102 Lee Center Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 160 | \$6.35 | \$1,016.00 | \$ 6.75 | 1,080.00 | 9 | \$475.20 | \$1,555.20 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 15 | \$792.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.10 | 976.00 | 17 | \$897.60 | \$1,873.60 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 21 | \$1,108.80 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 960.00 | 25 | \$1,320.00 | \$2,280.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-15000-03-GM A1502 Nelson Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 800 | \$6.35 | \$5,080.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 16 | \$4,224.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.45 | 5,160.00 | 10 | \$2,640.00 | \$7,800.00 | \$ 6.10 | 4,880.00 | 33 | \$8,712.00 | \$13,592.00 | \$ 7.50 | 6,000.00 | 15 | \$3,960.00 | \$9,960.00 | \$ 6.00 | 4,800.00 | 22 | \$5,808.00 | \$10,608.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-17000-03-GM A1702 Reynolds Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 2,000 | \$6.35 | \$12,700.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 22 | \$14,520.00 | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | 31 | \$20,460.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.10 | 12,200.00 | 3 | \$1,650.00 | \$13,850.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 30 | \$19,800.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 12,000.00 | 23 | \$15,180.00 | \$27,180.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-18000-03-GM A1802 South Dixon Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 2,000 | \$6.35 | \$12,700.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 10 | \$6,600.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.45 | 12,900.00 | 2 | \$990.00 | \$13,890.00 | \$ 6.10 | 12,200.00 | 30 | \$19,800.00 | \$32,000.00 | \$ 7.50 | 15,000.00 | 12 | \$7,920.00 | \$22,920.00 | \$ 6.00 | 12,000.00 | 20 | \$13,200.00 | \$25,200.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-19000-03-GM A1902 Sublette Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 1,500 | \$6.35 | \$9,525.00 | \$ 6.75 | 10,125.00 | 11 | \$5,445.00 | \$15,570.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 20 | \$9,900.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.10 | 9,150.00 | 23 | \$11,385.00 | \$20,535.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 29 | \$14,355.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 9,000.00 | 31 | \$15,345.00 | \$24,345.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-20000-03-GM A2002 Viola Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 5,000 | \$6.35 | \$31,750.00 | \$ 6.75 | 33,750.00 | 16 | \$26,400.00 | \$60,150.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 20 | \$33,000.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.10 | 30,500.00 | 7 | \$11,550.00 | \$42,050.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 29 | \$47,850.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 30,000.00 | 27 | \$44,550.00 | \$74,550.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-21000-03-GM A2102 Willow Creek Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | F.O.B. Road Dist trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 2,000 | \$6.35 | \$12,700.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 22 | \$14,520.00 | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | 25 | \$16,500.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.10 | 12,200.00 | 10 | \$6,600.00 | \$18,800.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | 35 | \$23,100.00 | #VALUE! | \$ 6.00 | 12,000.00 | 35 | \$23,100.00 | \$35,100.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-00000-03-GM Lee County | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-6 or CA-10 (Shoulder Stone) | F.O.B. County trucks at pit or quarry | Ton | 2,500 | \$6.35 | \$15,875.00 | \$ 6.75 | 16,875.00 | | | \$ 6.45 | 16,125.00 | | | \$ 6.00 | 15,000.00 | | | \$ 6.10 | 15,250.00 | | | \$ 7.50 | 18,750.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |

NOTE: ALL QUALIFIED FOB BID PRICES ARE ACCEPTED
EACH AGENCY WILL CHOOSE WHICH QUARRY TO USE

BID TABS - MARCH 2022 LETTING

| County | | Lee | | Date: | 3/14/2022 | | Name and Address | | Renner Quarries Ltd | | Macklin Inc. (Stone Ridge) | | Helm Civil | | Martin & Company (Oregon) | | | |
|--|--|---|-----|------------------------------|-----------|--------------|------------------|-----------------|---------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|--------------------|-----------------------------|------------------|---------------------------|------------|--------------|--|
| R.D.: | | Various | | Time: | 9:00 A.M. | | of Bidders | | 1700 S. Galena Ave | | 6098 Dement Rd | | 2283 US Rt 20 E, PO Box 750 | | 2456 E Pleasant Grove Rd | | | |
| | | FURNISH & SPREAD - AGG SFCE COURSE, TY B, CA-10 | | | | | | Dixon, IL 61021 | | Rochelle, IL 61068 | | Freeport, IL 61032 | | Oregon, IL 61061 | | | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: | | | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | | | Bond | Prequalified | Bond | Prequalified | Bond | Prequalified | Bond | Prequalified | Bond | Prequalified | |
| Terms: | | | | | | | | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | N/A | |
| Section | Group | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | |
| 22-01000-03-GM F202 Alto Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | Furnish & Spread on various Roads per Commissioner | Ton | 12,000 | \$11.25 | \$135,000.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | \$ 10.25 | \$ 123,000.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | | | \$ - | |
| Low Bid | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-17000-03-GM F1701 Reynolds Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | Furnish & Spread on Meridian, Thorpe and Herman Roads | Ton | 9,000 | \$11.25 | \$101,250.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | \$ 10.25 | \$ 92,250.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | \$ 11.20 | \$ 100,800.00 | | | \$ - | |
| Low Bid | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22-20000-03-GM F2002 Viola Road District | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Aggregate Surface Course Type B, CA-10 | Furnish & Spread on various Roads per Commissioner | Ton | 5,000 | \$11.25 | \$56,250.00 | \$ 12.45 | \$ 62,250.00 | \$ 10.25 | \$ 51,250.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | | | \$ - | |
| Low Bid | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |

| County | | Lee | | Date: | 3/14/2022 | | Name and Address | | Gasaway Distributors | | Sicalco Ltd. | |
|--|---|---------------------------------------|-----------|------------------------------|-----------|-------------|------------------|---------------------|----------------------|--------------------|------------------------|--|
| R.D.: | | Various | | Time: | 9:00 A.M. | | of Bidders | | P.O. Box 4986 | | 907 N. Elm St, Ste 100 | |
| | | ROAD DISTRICT, DUST PALLATIVE APPLIED | | | | | | Oak Brook, IL 60522 | | Hinsdale, IL 60521 | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: | | | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | | | Bond | Prequalification | Bond | Prequalification | |
| Terms: | | | | Five percent or by schedule | | | | Check | N/A | Check | N/A | |
| Section | Group | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | |
| 22-XX000-05-GM 8 Road Districts: Alto, Amboy, East Grove, Harmon, Marion, Reynolds, Sublette, Wil | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Calcium Chloride Solution, Dust Pallative | Furnish & Applied on Road | Flake Ton | 150.5 | \$340.00 | \$51,170.00 | \$ 341.00 | \$ 51,320.50 | \$ 345.00 | \$ 51,922.50 | | |

LOW BID