

BID TABS - MARCH 2022 LETTING

| County LEE COUNTY | | Date: 3/14/2022 | Name and Address of Bidders | | | Helm Civil | | Martin & Company | | MacDonald Trucking | | Rock Road | | |
|---|-----------------------------------|------------------------|-----------------------------|------------|------------------------------|---|----------------------|---|----------------------|--|----------------|------------------------------------|----------------|--------------|
| R.D.: HAMILTON | | Time: 9:00 A.M. | | | | 2283 US Rt 20 E, PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 | | 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Rd Oregon, IL 61061 | | 210 S. Memorial Street Ohio, IL 61349 | | PO Box 181 Janesville, WI 53547 | | |
| HMA RESURFACING | | AS READ | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: Five percent or by schedule | | | | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified |
| Terms: | | | | | | | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | |
| Section | | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | |
| 22-09000-00-GM | HARMON ROAD | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Bituminous Materials (Prime Coat) | Lb | 22,533.0 | \$0.55 | \$12,393.15 | \$0.55 | \$ 12,393.15 | \$0.10 | \$ 2,253.30 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Bituminous Mixture Complerte | Ton | 6,190.0 | \$75.00 | \$464,250.00 | \$77.25 | \$ 478,177.50 | \$73.10 | \$ 452,489.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Aggregate Shoulder, Type B | Ton | 2,561.0 | \$25.00 | \$64,025.00 | \$21.00 | \$ 53,781.00 | \$16.00 | \$ 40,976.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Total | | | | \$540,668.15 | | \$ 544,351.65 | Low Bid> | \$ 495,718.30 | | #VALUE! | | #VALUE! | |

LOW BID

| County LEE COUNTY | | Date: 3/14/2022 | Name and Address of Bidders | | | Helm Civil | | Martin & Company | | MacDonald Trucking | | Rock Road | | |
|---|-----------------------------------|------------------------|-----------------------------|------------|------------------------------|---|----------------------|---|----------------------|--|----------------------|------------------------------------|----------------|--------------|
| R.D.: MAY | | Time: 9:00 A.M. | | | | 2283 US Rt 20 E, PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 | | 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Rd Oregon, IL 61061 | | 210 S. Memorial Street Ohio, IL 61349 | | PO Box 181 Janesville, WI 53547 | | |
| HMA RESURFACING | | AS READ | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: Five percent or by schedule | | | | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified |
| Terms: | | | | | | | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | |
| Section | | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | |
| 22-13000-00-GM | DRY GULCH ROAD | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Bituminous Materials (Prime Coat) | Lb | 5,202.0 | \$0.55 | \$2,861.10 | \$0.55 | \$ 2,861.10 | \$0.10 | \$ 520.20 | \$1.30 | \$ 6,762.60 | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Bituminous Mixture Complerte | Ton | 1,425.0 | \$75.00 | \$106,875.00 | \$81.40 | \$ 115,995.00 | \$72.50 | \$ 103,312.50 | \$112.50 | \$ 160,312.50 | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Aggregate Shoulder, Type B | Ton | 595.0 | \$25.00 | \$14,875.00 | \$20.00 | \$ 11,900.00 | \$16.00 | \$ 9,520.00 | \$37.50 | \$ 22,312.50 | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Total | | | | \$124,611.10 | | \$ 130,756.10 | Low Bid> | \$ 113,352.70 | | \$ 189,387.60 | | #VALUE! | |

LOW BID

| County LEE COUNTY | | Date: 3/14/2022 | Name and Address of Bidders | | | Helm Civil | | Martin & Company | | Rock Road | | | | |
|---|---|------------------------|-----------------------------|------------|------------------------------|---|----------------------|---|----------------------|------------------------------------|----------------|--------------|-------------|--------------|
| R.D.: Palmyra | | Time: 9:00 A.M. | | | | 2283 US Rt 20 E, PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 | | 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Rd Oregon, IL 61061 | | PO Box 181 Janesville, WI 53547 | | | | |
| HMA RESURFACING | | AS READ | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: Five percent or by schedule | | | | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified |
| Terms: | | | | | | | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | |
| Section | | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | |
| 22-16000-00-GM | VALLEY RIDGE LANE & SHORELINE HEIGHTS ROAD | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Bituminous Materials (Prime Coat) | Lb | 4,871.0 | \$0.55 | \$2,679.05 | \$0.55 | \$ 2,679.05 | \$0.10 | \$ 487.10 | No Bid | #VALUE! | | \$ - | |
| | Bituminous Mixture Complerte | Ton | 1,220.0 | \$75.00 | \$91,500.00 | \$90.30 | \$ 110,166.00 | \$94.00 | \$ 114,680.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | | \$ - | |
| | Total | | | | \$94,179.05 | Low Bid> | \$ 112,845.05 | | \$ 115,167.10 | | #VALUE! | | \$ - | |

LOW BID

| County LEE COUNTY | | Date: 3/14/2022 | Name and Address of Bidders | | | Helm Civil | | Martin & Company | | Rock Road | | Curran Contracting | | |
|---|-----------------------------------|------------------------|-----------------------------|------------|------------------------------|---|----------------------|---|----------------------|------------------------------------|----------------|---|----------------|--------------|
| R.D.: WYOMING | | Time: 9:00 A.M. | | | | 2283 US Rt 20 E, PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 | | 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Rd Oregon, IL 61061 | | PO Box 181 Janesville, WI 53547 | | 2220 County Farm Road DeKalb, Illinois 60115 | | |
| HMA RESURFACING | | AS READ | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Proposal Guarantee: Five percent or by schedule | | | | | Approved Engineer's Estimate | | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified | Bid Bond | Prequalified |
| Terms: | | | | | | | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | |
| Section | | Unit | QTY | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | |
| 22-22000-00-GM | MOFFET ROAD | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Bituminous Materials (Prime Coat) | Lb | 9,412.0 | \$0.55 | \$5,176.60 | \$0.55 | \$ 5,176.60 | \$0.15 | \$ 1,411.80 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Bituminous Mixture Complerte | Ton | 2,584.0 | \$75.00 | \$193,800.00 | \$80.50 | \$ 208,012.00 | \$75.30 | \$ 194,575.20 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Aggregate Shoulder, Type B | Ton | 982.0 | \$25.00 | \$24,550.00 | \$22.00 | \$ 21,604.00 | \$16.00 | \$ 15,712.00 | No Bid | #VALUE! | No Bid | #VALUE! | |
| | Total | | | | \$223,526.60 | | \$ 234,792.60 | Low Bid> | \$ 211,699.00 | | #VALUE! | | #VALUE! | |

LOW BID